






















Response to Additional Questions from SCAP 
Re: Conversation with Jennifer Payne 2/14/13 
 
1. If the program costs less, but the students get all of the services (IMA, Football 
tickets) then what prevents them from staying in the dorms enjoying college life 
and taking all courses online? 
 
Response: 
We really believe the online format of the degree will be interesting to students 
whose situation (family, money, distance from campus) precludes them from 
being "on campus." We also believe those students who choose to attend the 
UW on-site program do so to engage in a more traditional college 
experience.  However, we are prepared for students who attend the on-site 
program to enroll in on-line courses.  Given the lack of dorm space, Housing and 
Food Services could easily give priority to students in the day program to ensure 
that no onsite student would lose a dorm space to an online student. 
  
2. They want more information on electives. She has the sense they want some 
assurance that the students will have to take a minimum of 45 credits from the 
UW (be able to transfer courses in as electives). 
 
Response: 
We are confident that we will be able to provide electives which currently exist in 
the College of Education and on-line. In addition, we are working to develop 
more offerings for undergraduates to fulfill this need. In future years, we will work 
with other units to provide a wider range of offerings. QUESTION: one of the 
members asked how we would negotiate with the reduced fees for enrollment, 
how would this impact courses taught by other units. Do you have any 
thoughts?  If we partner with other academic units to offer non-College of 
Education classes for these online students, the academic partner would receive 
instructional costs proportional to the number of ECFS online degree students in 
the class.  This process has already been established in the fee-based degree 
notebook and has been implemented on the graduate level. 
 
3. Given the admission process is "competitive", what will the process be if we 
get 500 applicants. Will UWEO screen the students, etc.... 
 
Response: 
The process for admissions to our on-site and on-line programs will be similar. 
Our current process includes a screening from our student service specialist and 
we have budgeted for an additional student service specialist for the on-line 
program as well. Once the applications are screened for minimum requirements, 
the files will be reviewed by the faculty.  
  
4. On p.8 of the document (under the section describing the state of online 
learning at the UW) we state that we have "offered 104 course sections in the 



pilot to 9,323 students." The member asks for clarification in that the numbers 
presented here indicate a 90:1 student:instructor ratio rather than the 50:1 
proposed and 45:1 that we indicate has been part of the UWEO courses. 
 
Response: 
UWEO has offered the pilot online learning class sections in many sizes and 
configurations.  Some of the class sections have been limited to 45 to 50 
students while others have attracted several hundred students.  
However, when the class section size exceeds 50 students, they provided 
additional instructional resources (either another faculty member or a teaching 
assistant) for the class section so each class section has one teacher (either a 
faculty member or a teaching assistant) for 45 to 50 students.  In other words, a 
class section of 150 would have three teachers.  In larger class sections, a 
faculty member serves as the instructor of record and supervises teaching 
assistants and adjuncts. 
  
The ECFS online program has committed to no class sections larger than our on-
site program, which is currently 50. We will also support a class over 40 with a 
reader/grader/TA. We are currently collecting data on some existing online 
undergraduate courses taught on-line (See EDSPE 365) by some of our current 
faculty and plan to use this data (and data like this in the future) to plan for 
supports in this new format. 
  


